## **EXHIBIT D**

2:07-cv-00919-DCN Date Filed 07/25/2007 Entry Number 93-5

Page 1 o

DAVID POPOWSKI - ATTORNEY AT LAW 171 Church Street, Ste. 110 P.O. Box 1064 Charleston, SC 29401-02 Fed. ID No. 57-0719942

Invoice submitted to:
Gregory Hays 2:07-cv-00919-DCN
Hays Financial Consulting, LLC
3343 Peachtree Rd., Ste. 200
Atlanta GA 30326-1420

Date Filed 07/25/2007 Entry Number 93-5

Page 2 o

June 01, 2007 In Reference To:

SEC v. Parish

Invoice # 20440

## Professional Services

		Hours	Amount
5/1/2007	Work on 1233, LLC, Power of Attorney research	0.30	84.00
	Work on filing Preliminary Injunction Order; work on Lis Pendens	0.80	224.00
5/2/2007	E-mail from Douglas re CFTC; email from Dantzler re ; emails from Dantzler and Douglas; telephone conference with Bruce Berlinksy re Ruthie Parish Ham	0.50	140.00
	Review CFTC Consent Order; draft letter to Douglas with Consent Order; review Swiss Supply Memo and Motion; review Ruth Hamm Parish documents from Berlinsky	0.80	224.00
	Review Bank of SC Title Search re Raven Run	0.10	28.00

	_	Hours	Amount	
5/2/2007	Papers re Injunction re Securities Dealing; Daniel Island Academy filing	0.30	84.00	E7
5/4/2007	Sign <b>2:07Pexr00949+DCN</b> der <b>Date:</b> Filed 07/25/2007 Parish; overview of Regions paper	Entoy Nun	nber <b>93-5.</b> 00	Page 3 o
5/8/2007	Work on letter to Assistant U.S. Attorney Douglas re CFTC	0.10	28.00	
5/9/2007	Work on filing Permanent Injunction and Lis Pendens; work on letter to Colleton County; received Ruth Hamm Affidavit and Attachments	0.60	168.00	25 25
5/10/2007	Telephone conference with Assistant Charleston County Attorney Manos; letter to Manos with Preliminary Injunction Order; receipt of filed TRO Order from Charleston County RMC	0.40	112.00	
	Work on filing Preliminary Injunction Order in Berkeley County; letter to Dantzler with Charleston County RMC document	0.40	112.00	10
	Work on Lis Pendens for Charleston, Berkeley and Colleton Counties	0.30	84.00	18 18
	Work on Lis Pendens; email from Arnold; review of documents re Ruthie Parish; telephone conference with Arnold	0.60	168.00	
5/11/2007	Letter from Douglas re CFTC; email from Emge, Attorney for Wayne Cassady, Battery; telephone conference with Dantzler; telephone conference with Arnold	0.70	196.00	

	·	Hours	Amount	
	re Ruthie Parish Hamm; letter from Beard re Bankruptcy			
5/11/2007	E-mail from Dantzler to Beard; work2:07-&vi-00949 de Dant and Datet Fiter 00/25/2007 transmittal; review file	1.70 Entry Nur	476.00 mber 93-5	Page 4 or
5/14/2007	Telephone conference with Murnahan @ SEC; Regions Affidavit; emails from/to Dantzler to Sharpe re Regions	0.40	112.00	
5/15/2007	Telephone conference with Werd @ Advertising Services re AJ Davis; receipt of filed Lis Pendens and Preliminary Injunction Order from Berkeley County	0.40	112.00	el .
	Draft letter to Dantzler with filed Berkeley County documents; work on letter to Dantzler; email from Sharpe, Atty from Regions; draft letter to Judge Norton; email to Dantzler and Sharpe	0.70	196.00	a
5/16/2007	E-mail from Pennington; telephone conference with Dantzler	0.30	84.00	<i>I</i> 5
	Receipt of filed Colleton County Lis Pendens; letter to Dantzler; email to Dantzler, et al re Conservator Mendelsohn re Appointment	0.50	140.00	
5/17/2007	Motion re Ruthie Parish Hamm; receipt of filed Lis Pendens for Charleston County properties; letter to Dantzler; email from/to Conner re AJ Davis Closing	0.50	140.00	
	E-mail from Cheshire; letter from Investors; meeting with Dantzler; email from Cheshire re 1233, LLC; work on letter Judge Norton re	0.90	252.00	

		Hours	Amount	
	Extension re Regions and email to Sharpe			
5/18/2007	Telephone conference with Sharpe; fili2:07exx:00910:DCAtterDate Rited 07/25/2	0.20 2007 Entry Nu	56.00 mber 93-5	Page 5 o
5/21/2007	Filing Regions Response Extension Request letter	0.10	28.00	ra.
	Telephone conference with Wertimer, Advertising Services re AJ Davis; review file; email to Dantzler, et al re Swiss Supply; telephone conference with Arnold; email from Dantzler Paralegal Cheshire	0.60	168.00	
	Telephone conference with Cheshire; draft Consent Order re Regions; emails from Cheshire	0.50	140.00	
5/22/2007	Work on Regions Consent Order; email to Judge Norton	0.40	112.00	
	E-mail from Dantzler and Arnold; Hearing Notice re Hamm	0.20	56.00	
5/23/2007	Telephone conference with Sharpe re Regions; email from Sharpe; telephone conference with Judge Norton's office re Regions Extension; email from Judge Norton's Secretary re Hearing; email from Dantzler	0.50	140.00	E 3
	Filed Regions Extension Order; email to Dantzler	0.20	56.00	
5/24/2007	Receiver response re Hamm; response to Swiss Supply	0.30	84.00	
5/25/2007	Telephone conference with Lane; email to Dantzler, et al; email from Dantzler; telephone	1.10	308.00	

		Hours	Amount	
	conference with Investor re Rockwells; email from Hays re email to Dantzler and Hays			
5/25/2007	2:07-cv-00919-DCN Date Filed 07/25/2007 E-mail re to Dantzler,	Entry Nui 0.60	mber 93-5 168.00	Page 6 o
	et al; review records for same; telephone conference with Hunter; email from Hays		3	
	Telephone conference with Hays	0.10	28.00	
5/28/2007	E-mail from Hays re ; email from Hunter re	0.20	56.00	
	Telephone conference with Colleton Countyy re filing Order; Swiss Reply	0.20	56.00	
5/30/2007	Telephone conference with Appraiser Bishop and Elaine at Edisto Rentals; email to Hunter re Same; telephone conference with Dantzler re ; emails from/to Hunter; email from Sharpe	0.80	224.00	
	re Regions			
	Overview of Second Interim Report; email from Dantzler	0.40	112.00	
	Telephone conference with Cheshire	0.10	28.00	
5/31/2007	Overview 2nd Report Exhibits; Attendance at Bond Hearing; overview of Motions filed; meeting with Dantzler and Hays; attendance at Hearing before Judge Norton	5.70	1,596.00	
	E-mail from Hunter re	0.10	28.00	
	For professional services rendered	24.00	\$6,720.00	

## Additional Charges :

		Amount	8
5/9/2007	Copying costs	13.20	
5/11/2007	Copy2:07-യം@@919-DCN Date Filed 07/25/2007	Entry Number 93-5.70	Page 7 or
	Copying Costs	10.50	v
	Lis Pendens (Berkeley, Colleton, & Charlest	ton) 60.00	#
	Total costs	\$89.40	8 19
	Total amount of this bill	\$6,809.40	# · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
	Previous balance	\$11,435.48	-
	Balance due	\$18,244.88	1 Si